Information Notice

Act Title
Accident Compensation Act 1985
Information Title:
Retrospective Commencement
Version:
159B
Section 99 of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 was amended by section 52 of the Accident Compensation Amendment Act 2010, No. 9/2010.  Section 52 is deemed to have come into operation on 3 December 2003.
Section 52 reads as follows:


52
Limits applying to contributions required towards supported accommodation costs

(1)
After section 99(16A) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 insert—


"(16B)
Despite subsection (15), the Governor in Council may, by Order published in the Government Gazette, fix limits in respect of contributions to be made by a worker towards the cost of supported accommodation.


(16C)
An Order made under subsection (16B)—


(a)
may fix limits that vary according to the type of supported accommodation in which the worker is residing;


(b)
takes effect on the date on which the Order is published in the Government Gazette or, if a later date is specified in the Order, on that later date.".


(2)
In section 99(17) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985, for paragraph (c) substitute—


"(c)
who then resides in supported accommodation—".

(3)
After section 99(18) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 insert—


"(19)
In this section—

supported accommodation means—


(a)
a residential facility in which residential care is provided under the Aged Care Act 1997 of the Commonwealth;


(b)
a supported residential service within the meaning of section 3(1) of the Health Services Act 1988;

(c)
a community residential unit within the meaning of section 3(1) of the Disability Act 2006;


(d)
a group home or other residential facility approved by the Authority for the purposes of this section.".
Section 99 of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 was amended by section 49(1) of the Accident Compensation Amendment Act 2010, No. 9/2010.  Section 49(1) is deemed to have come into operation on 12 December 2007.
Section 49(1) reads as follows:


49
Amendment of section 99—extension to modifications of home or car 


(1)
In section 99(5A), (5B), (5C), (5D), (5E), (5F) and (5G) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985, after "Authority" (wherever occurring) insert "or self-insurer".

Section 134AB of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 was amended by sections 57(4) and (5) of the Accident Compensation Amendment Act 2010, No. 9/2010.  Sections 57(4) and (5) are deemed to have come into operation on 
17 June 2009.
Sections 57(4) and (5) read as follows:


57
Actions for damages—amendment of section 134AB


(4)
For section 134AB(21) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 substitute—

"(21)
If a worker makes an application under subsection (4) in respect of an injury the worker must not make a further application under that subsection in respect of that injury.".

(5)
After section 134AB(28) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 insert—


"(28A)
For the purposes of determining a liability to pay costs, or an entitlement to be paid costs, under subsection (28)(b), (c) or (d), if the amount of a judgment, order for damages, settlement or compromise is required to be reduced under subsection (25), the amount of the reduction must be the amount of compensation paid—


(a)
to the date of the statutory counter offer under subsection (12); or


(b)
to the date of the deemed statutory counter offer under subsection (14).


(28B)
A reduction under subsection (28A) must be made before the reduction (if any) under section 26(1) of the Wrongs Act 1958 is made.".

Sections 91, 92, 92A, 92B, 98C, 134AB and 134AD of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 were amended by sections 53–54(5), 54(7)(8), 55, 57(2)(3), 60, 67, 68(1)(3)–(10)(13) and 70(1) of the Accident Compensation Amendment Act 2010, No. 9/2010.  Sections 53–54(5), 54(7)(8), 55, 57(2)(3), 60, 67, 68(1)(3)–(10)(13) and 70(1) are deemed to have come into operation on 10 December 2009.
Sections 53–54(5), 54(7)(8), 55, 57(2)(3), 60, 67, 68(1)(3)–(10)(13) and 70(1) read as follows:


53
Amendment of section 91

After section 91(7) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 insert—


"(7AA)
For the purposes of section 98C(2A)(a)(ii) and (iii), assessments of spinal impairment are to specify the whole person values derived in accordance with section 3.3 of Chapter 3 of the A.M.A. Guides.".


54
Compensation for non-economic loss


(1)
In section 98C of the Accident Compensation Act 1985, before subsection (1) insert—


"(1A)
In this section—

spinal impairment means a whole person impairment derived solely in accordance with section 3.3 of Chapter 3 of the A.M.A. Guides, without inclusion of any other impairment.".

(2)
In section 98C of the Accident Compensation Act 1985, for subsections (2) and (2A) substitute—


"(2)
The amount of the non-economic loss in respect of permanent impairment (other than psychiatric impairment and industrial deafness in respect of a further injury) is to be calculated as at the date of the relevant injury as follows—


(a)
if the worker's impairment benefit rating is less than 10%—the amount of the non-economic loss is zero;


(b)
subject to section 265, if the worker's impairment benefit rating—


(i)
is a modified whole person impairment (within the meaning of subsection (2A)(a)(i)) and is not less than 10% and less than 11%—the amount of the non-economic loss is to be determined in accordance with the formula—

$10 570 + [(D – 10) ( $9 010];


(ii)
is a modified spinal impairment (within the meaning of subsection (2A)(a)(ii)) and is not less than 10% and less than 11%—the amount of the non-economic loss is to be determined in accordance with the formula—

{$10 570 + [(D – 10) ( $9010]} ( 1.1;


(c)
if the worker's impairment benefit rating—


(i)
is not less than 10% and not more  than 30% and paragraph (b) does not apply to the worker—the amount of the non-economic loss is to be determined in accordance with the formula—

$17 040 + [(D – 10) ( $2560];


(ii)
is a spinal impairment (within the meaning of subsection (2A)(a)(ii) or (iii)) and is not less than 10% and less than 30% and paragraph (b) does not apply to the worker—the amount of the non-economic loss is—


(A)
the amount determined in accordance with the formula—

{$17 040 + [(D – 10) ( $2560]} ( 1.1; or


(B)
$68 240—

whichever is the lesser;

(d)
if the worker's impairment benefit rating is more than 30% and not more than 70%—the amount of the non-economic loss is to be determined in accordance with the formula—

$68 160 + [(D – 30) ( $4250];

(e)
if the worker's impairment benefit rating is more than 70% and not more than 80%—the amount of the non-economic loss is—


(i)
the amount determined in accordance with the formula—

$237 370 + [(D – 70) ( $26 570]; or


(ii)
$503 000—

whichever is the lesser;


(f)
if the worker's impairment benefit rating is more than 80%—the amount of the non-economic loss is $503 000—

where D is the worker's impairment benefit rating expressed as a number.


(2A)
For the purposes of subsection (2), a worker's impairment benefit rating is—


(a)
if the worker's degree of impairment consists of, or includes, a whole person impairment assessed in accordance with Chapter 3 of the A.M.A. Guides and that whole person impairment is not less than 5% and not more than 29%—


(i)
subject to section 265, the modified whole person impairment set out in column 2 of Schedule 2 opposite the relevant whole person impairment as assessed in accordance with Chapter 3; 


(ii)
subject to section 265, the modified whole person impairment set out in column 2 of Schedule 2 opposite the relevant whole person impairment as assessed in accordance with Chapter 3 for a spinal impairment;


(iii)
if subparagraph (ii) does not apply, the worker's degree of impairment as assessed in accordance with Chapter 3 for a spinal impairment;


(iv)
the worker's degree of impairment—

whichever provides the worker with the higher amount for non-economic loss under subsection (2);


(b)
in any other case, the worker's degree of impairment.

Note

Subsections (2)(b) and (2A)(a)(i) and (ii) do not apply with respect to injuries that occurred before the date of commencement of the Accident Compensation and Transport Accident Acts (Amendment) Act 2003—see section 265.".


(3)
In section 98C(3) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985, for paragraphs (b), (c) and (d) substitute—


"(b)
if the worker's degree of impairment is 30%—the amount of the non-economic loss is to be determined, subject to subsection (3AA), in accordance with the formula—

$17 040 + [(D – 10) ( $2560];

(c)
if the worker's degree of impairment is more than 30% and not more than 70%—the amount of non-economic loss is the amount determined, subject to subsection (3AA), in accordance with the formula—

$68 160 + [(D – 30) ( $4250];


(d)
if the worker's degree of impairment is more than 70% and not more than 80%—the amount of the non-economic loss is—


(i)
the amount determined in accordance with the formula—

$237 370 + [(D – 70) ( $26 570]; or


(ii)
$503 000—

whichever is the lesser;".


(4)
In section 98C(3)(e) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985, for "$355 650" substitute "$503 000".

(5)
After section 98C(3) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 insert—


"(3AA)
In relation to a relevant injury sustained on or after 3 December 2003 and before 1 July 2010—


(a)
a reference to an amount in dollars referred to in subsection (3)(b) is a reference to the corresponding amount in dollars applying at the time of the injury under section 98C(2)(c) as then in force in respect of permanent impairment;


(b)
a reference to an amount in dollars referred to subsection (3)(c) is a reference to the corresponding amount in dollars applying at the time of the injury under section 98C(2)(d) as then in force in respect of permanent impairment.


(3AB)
In relation to a relevant injury sustained on or after 3 December 2003 and before 1 July 2010, a reference to an amount in dollars referred to in paragraph (b), (c) or (d) of section 98C(2) is a reference to the corresponding amount in dollars applying at the time of the injury under that paragraph as then in force.


(3AC)
In relation to a relevant injury sustained before 3 December 2003—


(a)
a reference to an amount in dollars referred to in subsection (3)(b) is a reference to the corresponding amount in dollars applying at the time of the injury under section 98C(2)(b) as then in force in respect of permanent impairment;


(b)
a reference to an amount in dollars referred to in subsection (3)(c) is a reference to the corresponding amount in dollars applying at the time of the injury under section 98C(2)(c) as then in force in respect of permanent impairment.


(3AD)
In relation to a relevant injury sustained before 3 December 2003, a reference to an amount in dollars referred to in paragraph (b) or (c) of section 98C(2) is a reference to the corresponding amount in dollars applying at the time of the injury under that paragraph as then in force.".

(7)
In section 98C of the Accident Compensation Act 1985, in subsections (7) and (8) for "$355 650" substitute "$503 000".

(8)
After section 98C(10) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 insert—


"(11)
Despite anything to the contrary in this section or section 98E, a worker is not entitled to an amount of compensation for non-economic loss under this section or section 98E or both that exceeds the maximum amount payable under this section as in force at the date of the relevant injury.".


55
Alignment of lump sum and common law pain and suffering damages

In section 134AB(22)(b)(ii) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985, for "$438 320" substitute "$503 000".


57
Actions for damages—amendment of section 134AB


(2)
Section 134AB(19)(c) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 is repealed.


(3)
After section 134AB(19) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 insert—


"(19A)
Any finding made on an application for leave to bring proceedings in respect of the injury does not give rise to an issue estoppel in any proceedings for the recovery of damages brought in accordance with this section which is heard and determined on and from the commencement of section 57(3) of the Accident Compensation Amendment Act 2010.".


60
Repeal of section 134AD

Section 134AD of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 is repealed.


67
Compensation for death of a worker—amendment of section 92


(1)
For section 92(1) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 substitute—


"(1)
If a worker's death results from or is materially contributed to by an injury which entitles the worker's dependants to compensation, the amount of the compensation must be determined—


(a)
if a dependant does not have legal representation, or is a minor or a person under a disability, by the court in accordance with this section; or


(b)
in all other cases, by the Authority or self-insurer in accordance with this section.".


(2)
In section 92(3) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985, for "County Court" substitute "court, Authority or self-insurer".


(3)
In section 92(4) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985—


(a)
for "members of his or her family" (where twice occurring) substitute "members of the worker's family";


(b)
for "County Court" substitute "court, the Authority or self-insurer".

(4)
In section 92(6) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985, for "County Court" substitute "court, the Authority or self-insurer".


(5)
For section 92(7) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 substitute—


"(7)
A dependant is entitled to interest at the prescribed rate on an amount of compensation determined in accordance with this section—


(a)
in the case of a determination by the court—in respect of the period beginning on the date the claim for compensation was lodged in accordance with section 103 and ending on the date of the determination; or


(b)
in the case of a determination made by the Authority or self-insurer—in respect of the period beginning on the date the claim was lodged in accordance with section 103 and ending on the date the Authority or self-insurer makes the determination.".


68
Revised compensation for death of worker—amendment of section 92A


(1)
In section 92A(1) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985, in paragraph (b) of the definition of child—


(a)
for "21 years" substitute "25 years";


(b)
after "student" insert "or full-time apprentice".


(3)
After section 92A(2) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 insert—


"(2A)
For the purposes of this section and section 92B, a partner who resided with the worker at the time of the worker's death is deemed to have been dependent on the earnings of the worker at the time of the worker's death.


(2B)
Subsection (2A) applies to all claims first received on and from 10 December 2009—


(a)
by the Authority, whether forwarded by the employer or lodged by a partner to which that subsection applies; or


(b)
by a self-insurer, having been given or served on the self-insurer by a partner to which that subsection applies.".


(4)
For section 92A(3) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 substitute—


"(3)
If a worker's death results from or is materially contributed to by an injury which entitles the worker's dependants to compensation, the amount of compensation must be determined—


(a)
if a dependant does not have legal representation, or is a minor or a person under a disability, by the court in accordance with this section; or


(b)
in all other cases, by the Authority or self-insurer in accordance with this section.".


(5)
In sections 92A(4) and 92A(5) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985, for "$250 000" substitute "$503 000".


(6)
In section 92A(6) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985—


(a)
in paragraph (a), for "$225 000" substitute "$452 700";


(b)
in paragraph (b), for "$25 000" substitute "$50 300".


(7)
In section 92A(7) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985—


(a)
for "$250 000" substitute "503 000";

(b)
in paragraph (a), for "$12 500" substitute "$25 150".


(8)
In section 92A(8) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985—


(a)
for "$250 000" substitute "$503 000";


(b)
in paragraph (a), for "$187 500" substitute "$377 250";


(c)
in paragraph (b), for "$62 500" substitute "$125 750".

(9)
In sections 92A(8A) and 92A(8B) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985—


(a)
for "$250 000" substitute "$503 000;


(b)
for "County Court" substitute "court, the Authority or self-insurer".


(10)
In section 92A(9) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985—

(a)
for "$250 000" substitute "$503 000";

(b)
for "County Court" substitute "court, Authority or self-insurer";


(c)
for "the Court" substitute "the court, the Authority, or self-insurer".

(13)
For section 92A(12) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 substitute—


"(12)
A claimant is entitled to interest at the prescribed rate on an amount of compensation determined in accordance with this section—


(a)
in the case of a determination by the court—in respect of the period beginning on the date the claim for compensation was lodged in accordance with section 103 and ending on the date of the determination; or


(b)
in the case of a determination by the Authority or self-insurer—in respect of the period beginning on the date the claim was lodged in accordance with section 103 and ending on the date the Authority or self-insurer makes the determination.".


70
Weekly pensions for dependants of worker who dies—amendment of section 92B


(1)
For section 92B(9) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 substitute—


"(9)
A child ceases to be eligible under this section—


(a)
on attaining the age of 16 years; or


(b)
if the child is a full-time student or a full-time apprentice on attaining 16 years, whichever of the following occurs first—


(i)
on ceasing to be a full-time student or full-time apprentice; or


(ii)
the child attains the age of 25 years.


(9A)
For the purposes of subsection (9)(b)—


(a)
a child does not cease to be a full-time student or a full-time apprentice if that child ceases to be a student in order to become an apprentice;


(b)
a child does not cease to be a full-time student or a full-time apprentice if that child ceases to be an apprentice in order to become a student;

(c)
if a child attains the age of 25 years before ceasing to be a full-time student or full-time apprentice, the child remains eligible under this section until the end of the calendar year in which the child attains the age of 25.".

Sections 97 and 114 of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 were amended by sections 42 and 45(3) of the Accident Compensation Amendment Act 2010, No. 9/2010.  Sections 42 and 45(3) are deemed to have come into operation on 
1 January 2010.
Sections 42 and 45(3) read as follows:


42
Amendment of section 97

After section 97(1) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985, for paragraph (c) substitute—


"(c)
by way of accident make-up pay under any industrial award; or


(d)
in lieu of accrued annual leave or long service leave.".


45
Amendment of section 114


(3)
Before section 114(3) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 insert—


"(2D)
If the current weekly earnings of a worker are reduced because the worker is on paid annual leave or long service leave, the Authority or self-insurer must not, by reason only of that reduction, alter the amount of compensation in the form of weekly payments.".

The amendments made to section 98C of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 by section 90 of the Transport Accident and Accident Compensation Legislation Amendment Act 2010, No. 80/2010 are deemed to have come into operation on 10 December 2009.

Section 90 reads as follows:


90
Amendment of section 98C—non economic loss


(1)
In section 98C(1A) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 insert the following definition—

"relevant date, in relation to the calculation of the amount of non-economic loss under subsection (2), (3) or (3A) means—


(a)
if the worker's impairment benefit rating is not more than 70%, the date of the relevant injury;


(b)
if the worker's impairment benefit rating is more than 70%, the date on which the calculation is made;".


(2)
In section 98C of the Accident Compensation Act 1985—


(a)
in subsection (2), for "as at the date of the relevant injury" substitute "as at the relevant date";


(b)
in subsection (2A), for "subsection (2)" substitute "this section";

(c)
in subsection (3), for "as at the date of the relevant injury" substitute "as at the relevant date";


(d)
in subsection (3A), for "as at the date of the relevant injury" substitute "as at the relevant date".

(3)
In section 98C of the Accident Compensation Act 1985, for subsections (3AA), (3AB), (3AC) and (3AD) substitute—


"(3AA)
In relation to a relevant injury sustained before 3 December 2003, a reference to an amount of dollars—


(a)
in subsection (2)(c) is a reference to the corresponding amount in dollars applying at the time of the injury under section 98C(2)(b) as then in force;


(b)
in subsection (2)(d) is a reference to the corresponding amount in dollars applying at the time of the injury under section 98C(2)(c) as then in force;


(c)
in subsection (3)(b) is a reference to the corresponding amount in dollars applying at the time of the injury under section 98C(2)(b) as then in force in respect of permanent impairment;


(d)
in subsection (3)(c) is a reference to the corresponding amount in dollars applying at the time of the injury under section 98C(2)(c) as then in force in respect of permanent impairment.


(3AB)
In relation to a relevant injury sustained on or after 3 December 2003 and before 1 July 2010, a reference to an amount of dollars—


(a)
in subsection (2)(b) is a reference to the corresponding amount in dollars applying at the time of the injury under section 98C(2)(b) as then in force;


(b)
in subsection (2)(c) is a reference to the corresponding amount in dollars applying at the time of the injury under section 98C(2)(c) as then in force;


(c)
in subsection (3)(b) is a reference to the corresponding amount in dollars applying at the time of the injury under section 98C(2)(c) as then in force in respect of permanent impairment;


(d)
in subsection (3)(c) is a reference to the corresponding amount in dollars applying at the time of the injury under section 98C(2)(d) as then in force in respect of permanent impairment.".
