Information Notice


[bookmark: Acttitle]Act Title	Accident Compensation Act 1985

[bookmark: INTitle]Information Title:	Retrospective Commencement

[bookmark: ActRevision]Version:	194


Sections 5A, 92A, 100B and 100C of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 were amended by sections 26 to 29 of the Treasury Legislation and Other Acts Amendment Act 2014, No. 44/2014.  Sections 26 to 29 are deemed to have come into operation on 13 November 2013.
Sections 26 to 29 reads as follows:

[bookmark: _Toc386625218]	26	Amendment of section 5A
In section 5A(1)(a)(i) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985, for 
"on unpaid" substitute "not on paid".
[bookmark: _Toc386625219]	27	Amendment of section 92A
	(1)	In section 92A(6)(a) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985, for "$56 650" substitute "$55 530".
	(2)	For section 92A(8) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 substitute—
	"(8)	If a worker leaves a dependent partner, or dependent partners, and more than 5 dependent children, the amount of compensation is $555 350 of which—
	(a)	$416 520 is payable—
	(i)	to the dependent partner; or
	(ii)	if there is more than one dependent partner, in equal shares to each of the dependent partners; and
	(b)	the balance is payable to each of the dependent children in equal shares.".
	(3)	In section 92A(8B) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 omit "and none of subsections (4), (5), (6), (7), (8) or (8A) apply".
	(4)	In section 92A(8B) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985, for 
"this Act" substitute "the Workplace Injury Rehabilitation and Compensation Act 2013".
[bookmark: _Toc386625220]	28	Amendment of section 100B
In the Table to section 100B of the Accident Compensation Act 1985, in item 17, for "$155" substitute "$177".



[bookmark: _Toc386625221]	29	Amendment of section 100C
In the Table to section 100C of the Accident Compensation Act 1985—
	(a)	for items 5 and 6 substitute—
	"5	Section 92A(6)—$555 350
	6	Section 92A(6)(a)	—$55 530";
	(b)	item 11 is repealed.


Section 313 of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 was amended by section 30 of the Treasury Legislation and Other Acts Amendment Act 2014, No. 44/2014.  Section 30 is deemed to have come into operation on 5 April 2010.
Section 30 reads as follows:

[bookmark: _Toc386625222]	30	Amendment of section 313
In section 313(1)(b) of the Accident Compensation Act 1985 after "date" insert "and applies after the commencement date as if the current weekly earnings amount specified in subsection (3) as in force immediately before the commencement date were the current weekly earnings amount which applies from time to time under subsection (4) as in force after the commencement date".

